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1. Introduction
When analyzing an issue related to advertising creativi-
ty and street art, we cannot ignore the current problem 
that advertising faces every day: consumers and the cities 
are saturated of messages. It is interesting to investigate 
which is leading the advertising market to adapt to new 
formats as graffiti (Jacobson, 2017).) that encourage re-
membrance and make the message stand out above other 
impacts (Visconti, 2010). At this juncture, the image gains 
importance and, with it, the use of the technique of artistic 

appropriation by advertising that aspires, through its use, 
to generate pieces capable of being remembered by the 
viewer as artists do with their works.

Banksy's work has been chosen for its media capacity to 
get all its messages to viewers and to be heard despite the 
large number of artists that coexist in the current scene. 
Building a brand from anonymity, interrupting the narra-
tives of global ethics, distorting the viewer's imagination to 
make him reflect and his media character, are just some 
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of the characteristics that make Banksy the perfect artist 
for the study of how advertising takes advantage of their 
works to generate a greater impact on consumers.

The techniques and imaginaries of art by advertising are 
reviewed. As well as the artists who have used advertis-
ing iconography or have stood out for their contribution to 
advertising.

Appropriationism is addressed as a creative production 
technique. Noting Banksy as the main author of the cur-
rent today. And, therefore, the main inspiration for adver-
tising creatives who seek to appropriate a work of this 
movement.

2. Methodology
In the first place, a consultation of sources related to the 
binomial art - advertising, Appropriationism - advertising 
and Street Art - advertising has been carried out. Following 
the criteria of Roca and Mensa in their article The method-
ologies used in creativity research (Roca & Mensa, 2009). 
It was decided to approach the analysis from the perspec-
tive of case study and content analysis Krippendorf (1997) 
for the analysis of secondary sources: advertising cam-
paigns and Bardín (1983) for the analysis of advertising 
campaigns. Clemente and Santillana (1991) indicate se-
lecting various works of art and advertising pieces help us 
to have a descriptive view of the situation.

The corpus of primary sources stems from the analysis 
of advertising campaigns that are directly inspired by 
Banksy. Under this premise, we compile graphic mate-
rial of advertising creativity that are related to the artist. 
The analysis is based on the observation of advertising 
campaigns through an analysis template that focuses its 
objective on unraveling the typology of appropriationism 
and its relationship in space and time with Banksy's artistic 
production.

It is based on a technical file where we find a photo of the 
piece to be analyzed, the title of the campaign, if it had 
one, as a way of designating and differentiating the cam-
paigns, the type of product to which it refers, the brand, the 
agency in charge of creativity and a technical/typological 

description of the format: audiovisual, graphic, radio spot, 
etc. (Vega Cedeño, 2012).

Secondly, the part of the analysis that focuses on the for-
mal aspects of the piece will be made up of an objective 
description of the work in a general overall view, an icono-
graphic description of form and content where the formal 
description is explained in detail (Júnior, 2021). of the im-
age: including outstanding elements such as the use of 
form, a presentation of the composition giving importance 
to the different weights of the messages, the predominant 
color and their meaning, if any. The creative dimension: if it 
comes from an original idea, copy or reference of an exist-
ing work. Text description: analysis of the closing or copy 
of the campaign, messages that the brand wants to con-
vey with the piece. Iconography: description of the artistic 
elements with symbolic content. Style and/or aesthetics: 
Do you use any of the techniques followed by Banksy? Is 
it a photomontage or an illustration?

It is important for the analysis to determine to which peo-
ple the ad is directed, to try to determine if the use of the 
artist's works is focusing on a specific group. It is for this 
reason that in third place we will study the target. We 
need to know the tone of the message to know with what 
approach or in what way Banksy is being used to sell a 
product or service. When we come across campaigns that 
base their creativity on the connections between Social 
Media and Urban Art, (Sauda, et al., 2021).

Finally, we must present within the analysis several as-
pects directly related to the object of study: Banksy and 
Appropriationism. It is for this reason that we must empha-
size whether the iconography used coincides with some 
of the most outstanding stages of the artist's production, 
and whether they coexist over time. As we saw in the sec-
tion related to Appropriationism. We must classify the type 
of use of visual art in commercial communication (Díaz & 
Martín, 2016) focusing on the form of expression of the 
insertion of art in advertising and whether the artistic refer-
ence is found in the text or in the image.
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3. Results and discussion

3.1. Advertising appropriation of Banksy's work. Banksy-in-
spired advertising works
We exemplify in the figure of Banksy, since he is the most 
notorious and well-known representative worldwide within 
the artistic current of Street Art. To limit the spectrum of 
analysis of advertising campaigns that have as their cen-
tral axis some work of the mysterious artist, given his pro-
lific career and the great number of years that he has been 
active, we will focus on the creativities that emerged after 
the last and famous piece of the British artist Love Is In The 
Bin. Which generated a stir in the art world, since it was 
a self-destructed canvas in an auction house. This action 
should be highlighted because the media quickly picked 
up on it and transferred the news to all the front pages, 
both physical and online, and to the main newscasts. The 
impact on the networks was not long in coming. On Insta-
gram alone, the artist's photographic publication has more 
than 1,300,000 likes in addition to 17,127 comments and 
the video, 15,025,876 million views and more than 96,200 
comments. According to Direct Marketing, 2018, as of Oc-
tober 8, more than 1,578,325 conversations had already 
been generated on social networks on this topic.

3.2. People make design come to life. Furniture, Ikea
We observe located under the message “People make de-
sign come to life” some stairs going down to the Milan met-
ro with 6 stencils that integrate with the place where they 
have been placed. They are white with black shadows, 
well-defined but without volume. Regarding the composi-
tion and arrangement of the elements, we can see how 
they are arranged along the stairs, we have a central el-
ement for weight load, which would be the bodycopy with 
the message «People make design come to life» where 
we can also find the brand logo at the top. In the central 
part we find a dog and two children. The boy is playing 
with a ball, and the girl resembles the girl with the famous 
artist's balloon. On the right side of these, we find a ballet 
dancer who finds her dance bar on the railing of the sub-
way. To the left of the composition, we can see a figure 
climbing the stairs with her dog.

All template composition is under the message: “People 
make design come to life”. It makes reference that for this 
campaign they use this urban art technique to insert it on 
top of their conventional campaign. As for the iconogra-
phy of the graphic, we see Banksy's stencil technique very 
present together with a piece that resembles one of his 
best-known works, such as the girl with the balloon.

The technique used to carry out this action is the black 
stencil combined with a white background paper that 
would act as a canvas to capture the illustration and, later, 
put it on the wall. The creative dimension does not come 
from an existing work, but is a reinterpretation of the tech-
nique with a mix of creativity.

Given the repercussion of Banksy's work, we could affirm 
that we would find ourselves before a universal target. 
However, we must take into account the product and the 
brand that is advertised in this digital piece. IKEA sells fur-
niture, decoration and products for the home, so we must 
limit the target to which the advertisement is directed: cou-
ples, young people with a low budget, young people, stu-

Figure 1. People make design come to life (2012). 
Campaign title: People make design come to life. Prod-
uct: Furniture. Brand: Ikea. Launch date: 2012. Ty-
pology: Installation. Source: https://www.pinterest.es/
pin/491455378071118473/.
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dents, parents with children, etc. Seeing this segmenta-
tion, we would have a target audience of 22 and older. The 
tone of the message of this campaign is neutral; however, 
we can see how the use of such a guerrilla technique and 
support as the wall gives the brand a certain dynamism 
and freshness.

The Banksy coincidence is very subtle. In 2012, we find 
the production of some small stencils. But not yet, to talk 
about a great work by the artist, famous enough to enter 
the imagination of creatives and users, we have to go back 
to 2010 with the release of his documentary Exit Through 
the Gift Shop

Following the scheme of Díaz and Martín (2016) type of 
use of visual art in commercial communication, we would 
find an art reference in the image with a free representa-
tion of a part of the work. We are at the first “reference” 
level, since it evokes a technique or a style without em-
phasizing a specific piece.

3.3. Turn Back. Garlic, Clear cellophane tape, Scotch
In the work, we see a photograph of a frame on a flat white 
background that contains a stencil of a girl who loses her 
heart-shaped balloon. This image references Banksy's 
Girl with Balloon canvas. We can see the product that 
signs this ad: a cellophane tape and a Scotch brand box.

Regarding the composition of the graph, we see a predom-
inance of the size of the central box that occupies almost 
all the space. The frame is centered. In the right corner 
and weighing less than the central element, we find the 
still life of the product, which is made up of a cellophane 
tape and its box. In this announcement, we do not find 
any campaign closure message. As for the iconography of 
the graphic, it attends to a specific moment marked by the 
event of Banksy's latest work. As we saw before, the work 
self-destructs moments after being auctioned. Using this, 
Scotch highlights the main function, its product, which is to 
glue things that are separated. The style is based on the 
work of the British artist, he uses the stencil. It maintains a 
creative dimension that comes from the reinterpretation of 
an existing painting.

Figure 2. Girl with Balloon or There is Always Hope, version in South Bank (Banksy, 2004). Source: https://commons.
wikimedia.org/wiki/File:Banksy_Girl_and_Heart_Balloon_(2840632113).jpg
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The audience is not limited by an age segment, but is only 
suitable for people who previously knew how Love Is In 
The Bin was created. Based on this premise, we find that, 
given its worldwide viralization, it would be a universal tar-
get.

We are facing a graphic that has meaning only at a visual 
level that objectively transmits the values of the product, 
so the tone of it could be said to be rational or informative.
There is a month and year coincidence with the production 
of Love Is In The Bin, both actions were created in October 
2018, only a few days apart. We are before a work whose 
existence would not be possible without the previous work.
The work presents a type of use of visual art in commercial 
communication, according to Díaz and Martín, (2016). Fol-
lowing the scheme mentioned above, we find ourselves 
before a graphic that presents an art reference in the im-
age, with a point-by-point representation of the complete 
work and with a direct use of it.Figure 3. Campaign Title: Turn Back Time. Product: 

Transparent cellophane tape. Brand: Scotch. Release 
date: October, 2018. Agency: Garlic. Source:  https://www.
flickr.com/photos/dropstuff/2840632113/  https://www.ad-
softheworld.com/media/print/scotch_turn_back_time

Figure 4. Love is in the Bin (Banksy, 2018) Technical 
description / Typology: art intervention by Banksy at So-
theby's London. Source:  https://www.theguardian.com/
artanddesign/2021/oct/14/banksy-auction-record-shred-
ded-painting-love-is-in-the-bin

Figure 5. Masterpiece. (The Smarts, 2018). Campaign ti-
tle: Masterpiece. Product: Carpet. Brand: IKEA. Release 
date: October, 2018. Agency: The Smarts. Technical de-
scription / Typology: Digital Graphics Source: https://www.
adsoftheworld.com/media/digital/ikea_masterpiece
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Fernández Herrero, (2018) points out that we are between 
a level of inspiration, another of recreation that serves as 
a connection. At the level of inspiration we see how the 
image of the campaign emphasizes a specific interven-
tion, but since it is a point-by-point representation of the 
complete work, with a direct use of it, we would enter the 
third level of "recreation" in where you can find the works 
made by artists, although Banksy has not directly carried 
out the campaign.

3.4. Masterpiece. The Smarts. Carpet, Ikea
We see a photographic frame on a dark navy blue tex-
tured background (Figure 5). The painting contains a rug 
whose fringes peek out from under the aforementioned 
frame. We see a copy that says: “Masterpiece that every-
one can own” and another within the canvas that mentions 
the product and its price. We can see the Ikea signature at 
the bottom of the ad.

As for the composition and layout of the elements and 
messages in the graphic, we find that the photographic 
frame occupies the central part of the advertisement, com-
peting in dimensions with the body of text «Masterpiece 
that everyone can own». Both, as a composition, occupy 
the center of the piece. Inside what appears to be a rug 
from the Swedish brand, we find the name, description 
and price of this product. In the lower part on the right, 
with less significant weight, we find the IKEA logo.

In this work we find several blocks of text. If we take into 
account the weights, we would first have the concept of 
the graph that says «Masterpiece that everyone can own» 
– «A masterpiece that everyone can own». At a second 
level of information we see «RORKAR Rug with stripes 
flatwoven 39.90 lv» which refers to the product and its 
price.

Figure 6. Going Once, Going Fries, Gone. TBWA, 2008. Campaign Title: Going Once, Going Fries, Gone. Product: Fast 
Food. Brand: McDonald's. Release date: October, 2008. Agency: TBWA. Digital Graphics - Instagram Post Source: https://
www.reasonwhy.es/media/library/mcd-malta-parodia-banksy.jpg
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This work can only be understood if we previously know 
the events that occurred around the British artist in the 
month of October. Banksy's work was sold for $1.4 million 
at auction and then destroyed. IKEA refers to the fact that, 
with its rugs, you can have a piece of art at home for much 
less money.

Use the photographic composition technique with Pho-
toshop to create a realistic image of the overlapping of 
various elements. Regarding the creative dimension, ref-
erence is made to an existing painting, appropriating the 
imagery of the frame and the moment of launch, but it 
changes the image, giving it a new meaning.

Given the repercussion of Banksy's work, we could affirm 
that we would find ourselves before a universal target. 
However, we must take into account the product and the 
brand that is advertised in this digital piece. IKEA sells fur-
niture, decoration and products for the home, so we must 
limit the target to which the advertisement is directed: 
couples, young people with a low budget, young students, 
parents with children, etc. Seeing this segmentation, we 
would have a target audience of 22 and older.

The tone responds to a fun character, since, although the 
graphics do not visually give rise to this interpretation, the 
message wants to make fun of the price of the work sec-
ond prices before its self-destruction.

Figure 7. Storyboard with the results of the McDonald's Going Once, Going Fries, Gone campaign. TBWA, 2018. Source: 
https://www.adsoftheworld.com/media/digital/mcdonalds_going_once_going_fries_gone.tif
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There is a month and year match with the production of 
Banksy Love Is In The Bin, both actions were created in 
October 2018, only a few days apart. We are before a work 
whose existence would not be possible without the previ-
ous work. We are faced with a piece that has the artistic 
reference in the image and presents a free representation 
of a part of the work.

As for the degree of connection between advertising and 
urban art, we could classify this digital graphic in a level 
two of inspiration, since they evoke in the viewer a mem-
ory of an imaginary Street Art that they already know pre-
viously, but they allude to a specific one. It is the general 
aesthetics of the image that is done with the iconographic 
value of Banksy's work; neither the frame nor its interior 
respond to the original of the piece.

3.5. Going Once, Going Fries, Gone. Comida Rápida, Mc-
Donald’s
The creative features a photo frame on a black back-
ground with a grainy texture. We found a canvas with a 
figurative representation of an inverted McDonald's potato 
container. Protruding from the bottom of the frame, we see 
some textured yellow rectangles. We do not find the clo-
sure with the brand, but it is integrated into the image that 
contains the frame.

Regarding the composition and arrangement of the ele-
ments, we have as the only and central element of the 
graphic the photographic frame that contains a canvas of 
a representation of a container of McDonald's potatoes 
turned vertically. The frame is centered.

In this announcement, we do not find any campaign clo-
sure message. We can mention the text that was inside 
the Instagram post: «Going Once, Going Fries, Gone» 
which refers to the first Instagram post about the self-de-
struction of the work that it titled on social networks: «Go-
ing, going, gone».

The iconography of the graphic uses one of the most icon-
ic products of the McDonald's brand and mimics it with 
the work of Banksy. We see a direct relationship between 
the position of the original canvas and the appropriation 
created by the brand.

The technique is pictorial, it is a figurative representation 
with brush strokes texture. Aesthetically, it comes from the 
reinterpretation of an existing painting.

We are facing a piece created to live, be seen and sha-
red by social networks, so the target is very different. The 
brand is positioned before a universal target that is multip-
lied in scope due to the virality of this type of publication on 
social networks. The creative agency responsible for the 
piece, TBWA indicates that the number of people impac-
ted by the ad was more than 83 million.

Following the scheme of the type of use of visual art in 
commercial communication, we would find an art referen-
ce in the image with a free representation of a part of the 
work. But since on the inner canvas of the frame we find 
the product, the French fries, as a work of art, we could 
also speak of the category of content, product as a work 
of art or artification.

According to Fernández Herrero, we are at a second ad-
vertising level «inspiration» since the image of the campa-
ign emphasizes a specific intervention, exactly Love Is In 
The Bin (2018).

4. Conclusions
The creative dimension of the works always responds 
to some kind of representation of an existing work. After 
carrying out the analysis of the records of several of the 
pieces produced by the creative agencies that had some 
relationship with Banksy, we can observe a proliferation of 
the number of pieces related to the actions of the author 
in recent years. Due to the growing popularity of his works 
and their media magnitude, we found a high percentage 
of advertising campaigns related to Banksy as of October 
2018, coinciding with the presentation of his work Love Is 
In The Bin.
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On the other hand, it is worth taking into account the fact 
that, like the original piece, all advertising adaptations are 
made in graphic format. However, there is a characteristic 
that differentiates them and that is that advertising graphi-
cs are mostly shown in an online or digital format, because 
they take advantage of the moment of maximum efferves-
cence of the news to make their creativities, since, once 
this boom has passed its launch would not make sense. 
It is for this reason that the advertising pieces of this peri-
od related to the British were mainly launched in October 
2018.

One of the first things that should be highlighted and that is 
what makes us realize that we are dealing with a creative 
technique based on appropriation is the fact that in all the 
pieces the essential thing is a part of Banksy's iconograp-
hy. If there is something that makes the Briton distinctive, 
it is his defined style as an artist that stands out for the 
use of forms such as the police, children or rats. In the 
graphs analyzed above we see how the technical element 
that is repeated in all the compositions is not the famous 
stencil of the girl with the balloon, but rather the frame that 
it makes was what, thanks to its mechanism, formed a new 
work and that generated the most stir in the media.

On the other hand, we find in all the pieces an informa-
tive space that coincides with the end of the campaign, 
the brand or the advertised product, normally at the bot-
tom right, as in most graphics. However, something dif-
ferentiating is that we are faced with scarce or practically 
non-existent narratives or texts. They focus on the image 
speaking for itself, they seek for the viewer to draw their 
own conclusions or interpret the message based on their 
previous baggage of the work that starts from its virality. 
If we affirm that the message focuses on the image, it is 
logical that, following the typology of use of visual art in 
commercial communication, according to Díaz and Martín 
(2016), we find references to art in the image with a free 
representation or not of a part of the work, corresponding 
to the frame of the painting. In the type of advertising-ur-
ban art connection analysis, according to Fernández Her-
rero (2018), the vast majority of us would find ourselves 
facing campaigns belonging to a second level, since the 
image of the campaign emphasizes a specific interventi-

on. We could say that the tone of the pieces produced as 
a result of Love Is In The Bin is humorous, it refers to what 
happened in the auction house, ironizing or satirizing it. 
This fact, although it may go unnoticed, is interesting since 
it corresponds to the tone used by Banksy for his artistic 
production.

Although Banksy and the appropriation movement tend 
to have a transgressive, acid and strange character for 
the public, analyzing the files we realize that most of the 
advertised products have a very broad or universal target, 
without segmenting the viewer. They are brand products 
that are focused on giving maximum coverage to the maxi-
mum number of people.

As we mentioned before, it is interesting to see how the 
generated pieces are published the same month as the 
work of the artist from Bristol. Because they respond pra-
ctically in real time to a media event that was happening, 
the graphics do not appear in conventional media and are 
transferred to digital media that respond to the immediacy 
that a viral phenomenon demands.

If we look at the first advertising campaigns before 2018, 
we find that the appropriation years before was lower. As 
we mentioned before, these graphics look for digital media 
that reward immediacy. When we focus on advertising we 
find an importance of the support resembling what was 
done by the artist. The works were reflected, many of 
them, on the walls. All of them following the marked aest-
hetics of Banksy, using techniques that remind the viewer 
of the artist's templates. These first Banksy-based creativi-
ties do not temporarily coincide with an event in the artist's 
pictorial production. We can affirm that, for this reason, 
the form of appropriation focuses on the image, but at first 
it does not allude to a specific painting, but to the tech-
nique so characteristic of the artist. By providing Banksy's 
procedures with new messages, these campaigns do not 
have the ironic tone of those launched after October 2018. 
On the other hand, the target does coincide with the one 
we mentioned previously, once again we are dealing with 
products with a target universal.
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It is logical to find these differences between the creati-
vities inspired by Banksy, since his long history in time 
entails a coexistence with very different forms of adver-
tising. Nowadays, real time, social networks, low-budget 
campaigns and their virality are rewarded. On the contrary, 
before we saw formats that went out to the streets to seek 
the viewer's attention differently, they lasted for months on 
display and with larger budgets.

In response to this reason, we find a clear statement that 
emerged from the analysis, the creative dimension of the 
works always responds to some type of representation of 
an existing work.

4.1. Creative appropriation. The importance of artistic ima-
gination
We see how the artistic imagination and new creations 
influence the creativity of advertisers who try to make 
campaigns stand out in a saturated market. The user feels 
more and more reticent before advertising messages, but, 
as we have verified throughout this work, with the incorpo-
ration of a work of art, a transmission of values previously 
obtained is produced that favor the acceptance of adverti-
sing creativity by part of the target (Bengtsen, 2016).

Today, creative agencies find themselves with an added 
handicap to reach the user in the digital medium: imme-
diacy. They need to generate messages that respond to 
current issues and at the same time talk about the brand. 
This is where art becomes important, since when a work 
of art goes viral, as content, it is much easier to adapt to 
the attributes of a brand than other highlights because it 
has visual content.

In the practical block, after carrying out the analysis, conc-
lusions can be drawn such as that there is a growing num-
ber of campaigns that have some work related to Banksy 
due to the growing popularity of his works and the media 
magnitude of them. Previously, it was stated that a high 
percentage of advertising campaigns related to Banksy 
occurred during the month of October 2018, coinciding 
with the presentation of his work Love Is In The Bin. Faced 
with appropriations that have to respond to the immediacy 
of social networks, we find representations that focus on 

the image and that respond to integrating the differential 
element of the work into the advertising piece, in the case 
of the campaigns inspired by Love Is In The Bin we find in 
all the shredding framework (Vicente, 2018).

We find multiple differences with the creative production 
of a decade ago that related to Banksy's works, but it is 
logical to find them given that he has been active for more 
than twenty years and society in this time has changed 
greatly.

4.2. The symbiosis between advertising and art. Approp-
riationism, an inherent consequence of the art-advertising 
binomial.
Since Appropriationism emerged as a current with Pop Art 
due to the rise of consumer culture and the mass media, 
the imaginary of brands and advertising in art began to 
be used intensively and vice versa (Gúzner & Polanco, 
1991). . This appropriation is understood as the reuse of 
pre-existing images to give them a new message or me-
aning (Agustin, & Chan, 2022). The works are separated 
from their original context and the messages are subver-
ted, altered or simply copied, thus turning the piece into a 
new one that responds to a different discourse.

From that moment on, the symbiotic relationship betwe-
en advertising and art is strengthened. In the case of the 
use of appropriation as a creative technique, we see that it 
serves to capture attention, generate memory and change 
the user's perception. Due to the speed with which current 
trends change, it focuses on disruptive movements such 
as urban art and, in recent years, it is valued that the work 
is current. In conventional media where everything is alre-
ady seen, where nothing surprises, people continue to ad-
mire street art. as something disruptive (Sauda, Wessel, & 
Karduni, 2021).

We can affirm that there is a conscious use by brands of 
Banksy's iconography and aesthetics, since, as an artist, 
he responds to the premises necessary to make a suc-
cess of an advertising campaign based on a pictorial work. 
Banksy is an author known worldwide, with a strong easily 
recognizable aesthetic, which is always current. That is 
why such different brands are made with his aesthetic to 
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empathize with the target.

The main objective of the work was to respond to the hy-
pothesis that, due to the evaluations of the current adver-
tising system, we could find a direct relationship between 
the works produced by the artist and the advertising crea-
tivities that base his image on him. Given this assumption, 
we can affirm that Banksy's artistic production has expe-
rienced different stages of advertising, where creativity did 
not respond to the same criteria to be based on a work. At 
first, observing the campaigns of previous years housed in 
the annexes, we discover how there are differences with 
those analyzed in the body of this work. However, we must 
focus our attention on the analysis criterion that responds 
to the aforementioned hypothesis.

These creativities do not temporarily coincide with an 
event in the artist's pictorial production, since when social 
networks did not mark the day-to-day of agencies there 
was no prevailing need to launch campaigns that coincided 
with what was happening in the world. On the other hand, 
if we change our gaze towards the artist's latest works, we 
see how social networks were filled, by the brands, with 
pieces in digital format that alluded to the artist.

The use of social networks as a means in which brands 
are directly related to the target, transforming the adver-
tising world. We are talking about a world where formats 
can be uploaded for free and will be valued by the user in 
the form of likes. From here arises the importance of ge-
neral content related to current affairs, with which the user 
is interested in interacting.

We observe a growing tendency to use appropriation as 
a creative technique with works by artists that have gone 
viral or are current. This would lead us to confirm that there 
is a direct temporal relationship between the works produ-
ced by Banksy and the advertising creativities that base 
his image on him, and that it will continue to be so in the 
future. This does not happen when we focus on adverti-
sing pieces from previous years. Since, in these cases, 
the form of appropriation focuses on the image, but does 
not allude to a specific painting, but to the artist's repre-
sentative technique: the stencil. The works were reflected, 

on multiple occasions, on the walls, as Banksy does.

The union of the binomial art - advertising is something 
to preserve, from this type of relationship comes not only 
great advertising campaigns, but also great artistic works. 
In a world where all borders are blurred: we can move fre-
ely through space, obtain practically unlimited informati-
on thanks to the internet, communicate with people from 
all over the world. We are always connected in real time. 
We must follow trends that allow us to grow. That they 
help advertising in this difficult task of speaking in a global 
code that people understand, despite being increasingly 
segmented. Art is that tool that gives advertising creativity 
a universal character. It represents a common imaginary 
that facilitates the understanding of the message. Create 
a positive memory of the brand and give the brands that 
implement it a differential element, highlighting it among 
the thousands of impacts that each user receives.

References
Cortez-Agustin, K. J., & Lam-Chan, W. W. (2022). Under-
standing social critique in graffiti art from a (non-) West-
ern perspective: Chinese students comparing Banksy 
and Zato through photo-elicitation. Visual Studies, 1-16. 
https://doi.org/10.1080/1472586X.2022.2046497 

Bardín, L. (1989). Análisis de contenido, Akal, Madrid. 

Bengtsen, P. (2016). Hijacking Banksy:. SAUC - Street 
Art and Urban Creativity, 2(1), 60 - 66. https://doi.
org/10.25765/sauc.v2i1.45

Clemente, M. & Santalla, Z. (1991). El documento persua-
sivo. Análisis de contenido y publicidad. Deusto, Bilbao,.

Díaz, O. H., & Martín, M. Á. C. (2016). El arte en la publici-
dad. Tipologías del uso del arte visual en la comunicación 
comercial. Comunicación y medios, (34), 96-113. https://
doi.org/10.5354/0719-1529.2016.42715   



Liminal, State of In-betweennessSAUC - Journal V8 - N2

131

Gúzner, S., & Polanco, A. F. (1991). Arte y publicidad: esa 
extraña pareja. Lápiz: Revista internacional del arte, (77), 
60-68.

Heredero Díaz, O., & Chaves Martín, M. Á. (2018). Pub-
licidad con arte. El efecto de transfusión del arte como 
estrategia de branding para las marcas premium. Comuni-
cación. Revista Internacional de Comunicación Audiovisu-
al, Publicidad y Estudios Culturales, 16, 55-75. http://dx.doi.
org/10.12795/Comunicación.2018.i16.04

Jacobson, M. (2017). Marketing with graffiti:. SAUC - 
Street Art and Urban Creativity, 3(2), 104 - 111. https://doi.
org/10.25765/sauc.v3i2.86

Júnior, J. F. (2021). Autoria e ethos do artista de rua: o caso 
Banksy. Revista Saridh–Linguagem e Discurso, 3(2), 19-
19. https://periodicos.ufrn.br/RevSaridh/article/view/26373

Krippendorf, K. (1996). El análisis de contenido y sus fun-
damentos conceptuales. Paidós, Barcelona.

Lisa, J. A. V. (2016). El poder transformador del arte Arte vs 
Publicidad. Revisiones críticas desde el arte actual: Para-
ninfo de la Universidad de Zaragoza. AACADigital: Revista 
de la Asociación Aragonesa de Críticos de Arte, (34), 15.

Roca, D., & Mensa, M. (2009). Las metodologías utilizadas 
en las investigaciones de creatividad publicitaria (1965-
2007). Communication & Society, 22(2), 7-34 https://dadun.
unav.edu/handle/10171/8629 
Sauda, E., Wessel, G., & Karduni, A. (2021). Banksy. In So-
cial Media and the Contemporary City (pp. 125-133). Rout-
ledge.

Vega Cedeño, B. (2012). Lenguaje visual publicitario como 
sistema de comunicación en el Street Art: creación y di-
fusión, 153. https://ddd.uab.cat/record/103623

Vicente, Alez. (2018). El curioso caso del ‘banksy’ en la trit-
uradora. El País 7 de Octubre de 2018, https://elpais.com/
cultura/2018/10/06/actualidad/1538820063_864193.html

Visconti, L. M., Sherry, J. F., Borghini, S., y Anderson, L. 
(2010). Street art, sweet art? Reclaiming the "Public" in 
public place. Journal of Consumer Research, 37(3), 511-
529. https://doi.org/10.1086/652731

Ybarra, J. L . L. S. (2011). Arte y publicidad: Intersección y 
desencuentro.  En Estudios sobre arte y comunicación so-
cial. Crespo Fajardo J.L. y Bautista Duran A. (Coords.) pp. 
31-40. Tenerife, Sociedad Latina de Comunicación Social. 
http://www.revistalatinacs.org/067/cuadernos/00_Crespo.
pdf


